
To: elderland.nl]
Cc: gelderland.nl]
From: 5.1.2e

Sent: Wed 5/22/2024 7:38:00 AM

Subject: FW: Invoice attached - Order #4017554

Received: Wed 5/22/2024 7:38:05 AM

20240517-01 Provincie Geldarland NL wolves.pdf

os: INCAEC

Het hybridisatieonderzoek kostte | EEE BTW.

Het onderzoeksinstituut had wat tegenslagen maar heeft die voor eigen rekening genomen.

Groet, IESE

Van: Divjalabs <info@divjalabs.com>
Verzonden: vrijdag 17 mei 2024 10:51

Aan: facturen <facturen@gelderland.nl>

Onderwerp: Invoice attached - Order #4017554

Dear Sir/Madam,

| am sending the invoice for your order number 4017554 in the attachment.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Thank you and kind regards,

5.1.2e

5.1.2e
[Viber, WhatsApp]

www.divjalabs.com
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